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Although the name Pithecanthropus is now seldom used, there are few who study the origin of our species
who will fail to recognise the historical place of the usage and its association with Eugene Dubois. During
the last thirty or forty years, Australopithecus and its African context has tended to draw attention from the
early work on our origins in Java. It is now increasingly common to hear the term 'pithecanthropine' used
only to indicate the Asian or Far Eastern examples of Homo erectus which, although probably derived from
African ancestry, have some features that in the opinion of some experts may justify their being considered
distinctive. This discussion is not within the pages that follow which deal extensively with the work of
Eugene Dubois. He was an extraordinary man who did as much as any person since to put the great antiquity
of our ancestors firmly in the public domain. Dubois became involved with the study of human origins from
a medical and anatomical background as have many since. The jealousies and professional pressures that we
think of as a phenomenon of the post-war years were clearly a major factor in deciding the future of his
career.
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From reader reviews:

Barbara Cook:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be up-date about what going on or data even knowledge
to make these people keep up with the era that is certainly always change and move forward. Some of you
maybe will update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems
coming to you actually is you don't know what one you should start with. This Eugène Dubois and the Ape-
Man from Java: The History of the First 'Missing Link' and Its Discoverer is our recommendation so you
keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Jennifer Garza:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them household or
their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, as well as playing
video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity that is look different you can read the book. It
is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent the entire day to reading a
guide. The book Eugène Dubois and the Ape-Man from Java: The History of the First 'Missing Link' and Its
Discoverer it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. We
were holding enjoying reading this book. Should you did not have enough space bringing this book you can
buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book from the smart phone. The price is not too
expensive but this book provides high quality.

Nancy Samuel:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with pals is thing that usually
you could have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try matter that really opposite from
that. Just one activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition info. Even you love Eugène Dubois and the Ape-Man from Java: The
History of the First 'Missing Link' and Its Discoverer, you are able to enjoy both. It is fine combination right,
you still wish to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't
buy it, oh come on its referred to as reading friends.

Alberto Alvarez:

As a college student exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library in order
to make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's spirit
or real their leisure activity. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to the library. They go to there
but nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring in addition to
can't see colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important for you
personally. As we know that on this time, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says,
ways to reach Chinese's country. So , this Eugène Dubois and the Ape-Man from Java: The History of the



First 'Missing Link' and Its Discoverer can make you sense more interested to read.
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