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In CASTRO'S SECRETS, highly acclaimed author and intelligence expert Brian Latell offers a strikingly
original view of Fidel Castro in his role as Cuba's supreme spymaster. Based on interviews with high level
defectors from Cuba's powerful intelligence and security services, long-buried secrets of Fidel's nearly 50-
year reign are exposed for the first time. They include numerous assassinations and attempted ones carried
out on Castro's orders, some against foreign leaders. More than a dozen ranking Cuban secret agents
embraced by the CIA and FBI speak in these pages; some have never told their stories on the record before.
Latell also probes dispassionately into the CIA's most deplorable plots against Cuba - including previously
obscure schemes to assassinate Castro - and presents shocking new conclusions about what Fidel actually
knew of Lee Harvey Oswald prior to the assassination of John F. Kennedy.
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From reader reviews:

Alexandra Sauer:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. As it is
known to us that book is very important for all of us. The book Castro's Secrets: Cuban Intelligence, The
CIA, and the Assassination of John F. Kennedy ended up being making you to know about other information
and of course you can take more information. It is quite advantages for you. The book Castro's Secrets:
Cuban Intelligence, The CIA, and the Assassination of John F. Kennedy is not only giving you more new
information but also to get your friend when you feel bored. You can spend your current spend time to read
your e-book. Try to make relationship with all the book Castro's Secrets: Cuban Intelligence, The CIA, and
the Assassination of John F. Kennedy. You never really feel lose out for everything should you read some
books.

Dana Register:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with friends is thing that
usually you have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try thing that really opposite from
that. A single activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you are
ride on and with addition details. Even you love Castro's Secrets: Cuban Intelligence, The CIA, and the
Assassination of John F. Kennedy, you could enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still desire to
miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't understand it, oh
come on its called reading friends.

Bruce Sandlin:

This Castro's Secrets: Cuban Intelligence, The CIA, and the Assassination of John F. Kennedy is great book
for you because the content that is full of information for you who always deal with world and possess to
make decision every minute. This book reveal it information accurately using great arrange word or we can
state no rambling sentences in it. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't
mean it only gives you straight forward sentences but tough core information with splendid delivering
sentences. Having Castro's Secrets: Cuban Intelligence, The CIA, and the Assassination of John F. Kennedy
in your hand like finding the world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that no
publication that offer you world in ten or fifteen moment right but this guide already do that. So , this is good
reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt this?

Tonya Quick:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you
might have it in e-book means, more simple and reachable. This kind of Castro's Secrets: Cuban Intelligence,
The CIA, and the Assassination of John F. Kennedy can give you a lot of friends because by you looking at
this one book you have issue that they don't and make a person more like an interesting person. This kind of



book can be one of one step for you to get success. This guide offer you information that maybe your friend
doesn't know, by knowing more than other make you to be great folks. So , why hesitate? Let's have Castro's
Secrets: Cuban Intelligence, The CIA, and the Assassination of John F. Kennedy.
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