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Kaffe Fassett has led an extraordinary life and is a captivating storyteller with a vivid memory. Born in 1937,
he spent much of his youth in Big Sur, California, where his parents bought a cabin from Orson Welles and
transformed it into the world-famous Nepenthe restaurant, a gathering place for artists and bohemians. After
attending a boarding school run by the disciples of Krishnamurti, an Indian guru, he studied painting at the
School of the Museum of Fine Arts in Boston, then traveled to England, where he made his home. After an
inspiring trip to Inverness, Scotland, Fassett began designing knitwear for Bill Gibb, and then the Missonis,
Vogue magazine, and private clients like Lauren Bacall and Barbra Streisand, and, in the process,
revolutionized the handknitting world with his explosive use of color. Further explorations led him to
needlepoint, mosaics, rugmaking, tapestries, yarn and fabric design, costume and set design, and quilting.
Now in his seventies, Fassett continues to produce new work and to travel worldwide to teach and lecture. In
this intimate autobiography, Fassett shares rich, detailed stories about his lifelong creative journey as well as
hundreds of glorious photos taken along the way.
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From reader reviews:

Ronnie Johnson:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yep, you can
choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a
walk, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or maybe read a book titled Kaffe Fassett:
Dreaming in Color: An Autobiography? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You realize beside you can
spend your time together with your favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with the opinion
or you have different opinion?

Kellie Stephens:

Here thing why that Kaffe Fassett: Dreaming in Color: An Autobiography are different and trustworthy to be
yours. First of all reading a book is good nonetheless it depends in the content of it which is the content is as
delightful as food or not. Kaffe Fassett: Dreaming in Color: An Autobiography giving you information
deeper as different ways, you can find any reserve out there but there is no guide that similar with Kaffe
Fassett: Dreaming in Color: An Autobiography. It gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up your own
eyes about the thing in which happened in the world which is might be can be happened around you. It is
easy to bring everywhere like in park, café, or even in your technique home by train. Should you be having
difficulties in bringing the branded book maybe the form of Kaffe Fassett: Dreaming in Color: An
Autobiography in e-book can be your choice.

Kimberly Moore:

Often the book Kaffe Fassett: Dreaming in Color: An Autobiography has a lot associated with on it. So when
you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was published by the very famous
author. Tom makes some research prior to write this book. This specific book very easy to read you may get
the point easily after scanning this book.

Gregory Medina:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many question for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
reading through, not only science book but in addition novel and Kaffe Fassett: Dreaming in Color: An
Autobiography or even others sources were given information for you. After you know how the great a book,
you feel wish to read more and more. Science publication was created for teacher or even students especially.
Those guides are helping them to include their knowledge. In additional case, beside science book, any other
book likes Kaffe Fassett: Dreaming in Color: An Autobiography to make your spare time more colorful.
Many types of book like this.
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