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From the bestselling author of Plan B comes a funny and touching new novel about a girl, a boy, and a
notebook that could ruin everything.

Emily Abbott has always been considered the Girl Most Likely to Be Nice -- but lately being nice hasn't
done her any good. Her parents have decided to move the family from Chicago back to their hometown of
Boston in the middle of Emily's senior year. Only Emily's first real boyfriend, Sean, is in Chicago, and so is
her shot at class valedictorian and early admission to the Ivy League. What's a nice girl to do?

Then Sean dumps Emily on moving day and her father announces he's staying behind in Chicago "to tie up
loose ends," and Emily decides that what a nice girl needs to do is to stop being nice.

She reconnects with her best friends in Boston, Josie and Lucy, only to discover that they too have been on
the receiving end of some glaring Guy Don'ts. So when the girls have to come up with something to put in
the senior class time capsule, they know exactly what to do. They'll create a not-so-nice reference guide for
future generations of guys -- an instruction book that teaches them the right way to treat girls.

But when her friends draft Emily to test out their tips on Luke Preston -- the hottest, most popular guy in
school, who just broke up with Josie by email -- Emily soon finds that Luke is the trickiest of test subjects . .
. and that even a nice girl like Emily has a few things to learn about love.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Gillon:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yep, you can
choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a move,
shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or maybe read a book eligible The Book of Luke?
Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You understand beside you can spend your time with your favorite's
book, you can better than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have other opinion?

Thomas Barreto:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive right
now, people have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place
and notice by means of surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated the idea for
a while is reading. Yep, by reading a e-book your ability to survive raise then having chance to stand than
other is high. For you personally who want to start reading a new book, we give you this specific The Book
of Luke book as beginner and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Patti Metivier:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their spare time with their
family, or all their friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, planning to beach,
or picnic within the park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Will you something
different to fill your own free time/ holiday? May be reading a book can be option to fill your cost-free time/
holiday. The first thing you ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to try out look
for book, may be the publication untitled The Book of Luke can be very good book to read. May be it might
be best activity to you.

Christian Robbins:

Within this era which is the greater person or who has ability to do something more are more precious than
other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you should do
is just spending your time not very much but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of many books
in the top collection in your reading list is The Book of Luke. This book which can be qualified as The
Hungry Slopes can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking right up and review this publication
you can get many advantages.
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